
DOBSON 
DOLPHIN 
SWIM TEAM 

Directions: 
   From 601‚ Take Dobson Exit, at top of exit turn right if 
coming from Mt. Airy and Left if coming from 
Yadkinville/Boonville. Turn right at the traffic light 
beside Kerr Drug. Turn left at next light. Follow that road 
approximately ½ mile until you come to Gillespie Street. 
Take a right on the second hard surface road on past 
Elementary School. Pool will be on your left. 

Directions: 
   From I-77‚ Take exit 93 turn right toward Dobson go 
approximately 3 miles. After you pass Central Middle 
School take the 2nd hard surface road to the left. This will 
be Gillespie Street. Pool will be on your left. 

ELKIN WET 
LIGHTNING 
SWIM TEAM 

Directions: 
   From I-77, take exit 85 (Elkin/CC Camp Road). Turn 
right off the ramp onto Hwy 268 Bypass. Turn left at third 
light (Lowe's Home Improvement). Make first right onto 
Claremont Drive. Go through one stoplight (Claremont 
Drive turns into Oakland Drive here). When you come to 
the end of Oakland Drive (stop sign), the recreation 
building is across the street. Turn left at stop sign onto 
Hwy 268 and you will see the parking lot and pool on the 
right. Make the first right into the main entrance to the 
park. 

GALAX 
RIPTIDE SWIM 
TEAM 

Directions: 
   Coming from I-77 North Carolina - you can take the 
Highway 89 exit. Continue on 89 West toward Galax. Go 
thru 1 stoplight. Pool will be on your right past Felts Park. 
If you pass Hardee’s you have gone too far. 

Directions: 
    VA Teams – Traveling I-77 take exit 14  Travel 
highway 58 west towards Galax (approximately 8 miles) 
You will go through 8 stoplights, Turn left on to Highway 



89 at 9th stoplight. Continue on Highway 89 (Main Street) 
You will go through downtown Galax and travel through 
5 stoplights Pool will be on your left after you have come 
through down and passed Hardees on your left. Park in 
Elementary school parking lot on right cross at stoplight 
to pool entrance.  

MOUNT AIRY 
REEVES 
RAPIDS 

Directions: 
   From VA‚ Take 77 South from VA. Take exit 100. Go 
right which will be 89 East toward Mount Airy. At the 6th 
stoplight go straight. Turn left into Parking Lot. Walk 
through Tunnel to pool. 

Directions: 
   From Elkin‚ Dobson‚  Take 77 South from VA. Take 
exit 100. Go right which will be 89 East toward Mount 
Airy. At the 6th stoplight go straight. Turn left into 
Parking Lot. Walk through Tunnel to pool. 

CARROLL 
WELLNESS 
CENTER - 
TIGERSHARKS 

Directions: 
   From Interstate I-77‚ Starting from I-77 (exit 14) Go 
east on Carrollton Pike (highway 58) approximately 2 
miles Turn left on Floyd Pike (highway 221) 
approximately 0.1 miles Turn left on E. Grayson 
approximately 0.1 miles Turn right just past (Granite sign 
with Carter Pines-Carroll Wellness Center.) Welcome to 
Carroll Wellness Center located at the end of the road. 

Directions: 
   From Highway 52 North‚ At Red light located at 
intersection of Highway 52 and Main Street (Pizza Hut on 
Right) Turn right on Highway 58 go approximately .2 
miles Turn Left on Floyd Pike (highway 221) 
approximately 0.1 miles Turn left on E. Grayson 
approximately 0.1 miles Turn right just past (Granite sign 



with Carter Pines-Carroll Wellness Center.) Welcome to 
Carroll Wellness Center located at the end of the road. 

WYTHEVILLE 
WAVES SWIM 
TEAM 

Directions: 
   OUTDOOR POOL - McWane Pool‚ From North 
Carolina travel Interstate 77 North until you come to I-81, 
continue to the left which becomes I 81/ I 77 South 
Traveling Interstate 81 South Take Exit #73 (Wytheville 
Community College Exit) go straight down ramp this will 
put you on main street. Go through 3 stop lights. You will 
pass BB&T Bank, Wendy’s on your left Sonic on your 
right. At the 4th light take a right onto 11th street. STAY 
IN THE LEFT LANE Take a left onto Monroe Street. Go 
through 2 lights You will pass the library and municipal 
offices. McWane Pool will be on your right. You can park 
at McWane pool or at the municipal offices. 

WILKESBORO 
AQUATECH 

Directions: 
   Take I 77 to exit 73 B to merge onto US-421 N toward 
N Wilkesboro Take exit 285 toward Wilkesboro/Brushy 
Mtn Rd Turn right at NC-1001/Oakwoods Rd Slight Right 
at NC-18/NC-268/Wilkesboro Blvd Right at NC-18/268 
Facility is shared with Corner Stone Church immediately 
on right and behind Myers Tire. 418 Wilkesboro Blvd, 
Wilkesboro, NC 29697 

 


